
Terms of Use 

Welcome to Rits Capital ("Company," "we," "us," or "our"). By accessing or using our 
website ("Site"), you agree to comply with and be bound by the following terms and 
conditions ("Terms of Use"). If you do not agree to these terms, you may not use the Site. 

1. Acceptance of Terms By accessing, browsing, or using this Site, you acknowledge 
that you have read, understood, and agree to be bound by these Terms of Use. We 
reserve the right to amend or modify these terms at any time without prior notice. Your 
continued use of the Site constitutes your acceptance of any changes. 

2. Use of the Site The content provided on this Site is for informational purposes only. 
You agree to use the Site for lawful purposes and in a way that does not infringe the 
rights of, restrict, or inhibit anyone else’s use and enjoyment of the Site. 

3. Intellectual Property All content, trademarks, logos, and intellectual property 
displayed on the Site are owned by Rits Capital or its licensors. You may not reproduce, 
distribute, or otherwise use any materials from the Site without our prior written 
consent. 

4. No Investment Advice The information provided on this Site does not constitute 
investment advice, recommendations, or an oƯer to sell or purchase any securities. All 
content is provided for general informational purposes only. You should consult with a 
qualified financial advisor before making any investment decisions. 

5. Disclaimers The Site and its content are provided "as is" without any warranties of 
any kind, either express or implied. We do not warrant that the Site will be error-free, 
uninterrupted, or free from viruses or other harmful components. We disclaim all 
warranties, including but not limited to, implied warranties of merchantability, fitness 
for a particular purpose, and non-infringement. 

6. Limitation of Liability To the fullest extent permitted by law, Rits Capital shall not be 
liable for any direct, indirect, incidental, special, or consequential damages arising out 
of or in connection with your use of the Site, even if advised of the possibility of such 
damages. 

7. Third-Party Links The Site may contain links to third-party websites. These links are 
provided for your convenience only. We do not endorse or make any representations 
about third-party websites, and we are not responsible for their content or accuracy. 
Your use of third-party websites is at your own risk. 

8. User Conduct You agree not to engage in any activity that could harm or disrupt the 
Site, including transmitting any harmful code, engaging in unauthorized access, or 
violating the security of the Site. 



9. Privacy Policy Your use of the Site is also governed by our Privacy Policy, which can 
be accessed [here/link to privacy policy]. By using the Site, you consent to the collection 
and use of your information as outlined in the Privacy Policy. 

10. Governing Law These Terms of Use are governed by and construed in accordance 
with the laws of California, USA or Delhi, India depending on jurisdiction of transaction 
or service. Any disputes arising out of or relating to these terms shall be subject to the 
exclusive jurisdiction of the courts of California, US or Delhi, India depending on 
jurisdiction of transaction or service. 

11. Termination We reserve the right to terminate or suspend your access to the Site at 
our sole discretion, without notice, for conduct that we believe violates these Terms of 
Use or is harmful to other users of the Site, us, or third parties, or for any other reason. 

12. Contact Us If you have any questions or concerns about these Terms of Use, please 
contact us on the contact details provided on our website. 

 


